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EXECUTIVE COMMITTEE MEETING
June 8, 1954

The meeting called for opening of bids for remodeling work in

the Mackay School of Mines building was held at 4 P.M. in the
President's office on June 8, 1954, the time set forth in the

bid notice for such purpose. Present were Chairman Ross and
Regent Hardy, Comptroller Hayden, Architect De Longchamps and
4 representatives of the bidding firms. Regent Lombardi was
traveling in Europe.

The bids were opened by the Chairman at 4:11 P.M. and were read
as per following tabulations:

BIDS FOR
ALTERATIONS AND ADDITIONS
TO LIBRARY, ETC. MACKAY SCHOOL OF MINES
BUILDING, UNIVERSITY OF NEVADA

CONTRACTOR CAPRIOTTI ROBERTS WEIL
Base Bid $31,600.00 $35,492.48  $39,075.00
Alt. #1 2,104.00 1,866.25 1,560.00

Alt. # 2 817.00 1,167.12 1,091.00

Alt. # 3 800.00 877.03 422.00

Alt. #4 320.00 313.35 126.95

Alt. #5 848.00 655.00 678.00

Alt. #6 1,576.00 1,798.00 1,426.00

Alt. #7 375.00 1,725.00 350.00

Alt. # 8 1,093.00 1,380.00 940.00

Alt. #9 3,127.00 1,600.00 3,080.00

Alt. #10 2,000.00 2,176.00 1,815.00

HANSEN No Bid
MAJESTIC No Bid
NOMELLINI No Bid
WALKER BOWDIN No Bid
WEICHMANN No Bid
WINE No Bid



The bids were then referred to the Comptroller and the Architect
for codification and for report to the Board.

Note: Recommendation was that the contract be let to the low
bidder, Frank Capriotti, for the above job (remodeling of
Library portion of Mackay School of Mines building).



